The City of

JOKLAHOMA CITY

City Clerk's Office
Frances Kersey, City Clerk
(405) 297-2391

BIDS RECEIVED AT 10:00 A.M. ON AUGUST 18, 2009
OCMAPS CONSTRUCTION ITEM #1 ES-0034 LEE ELEMENTARY SCHOOL RENOVATION/REMODEL

Company Eng Est/Boynton-Williams Anderson & House Downey Contracting, LLC
Base Bid $4,075,000.00 $3,400,000.00 $2,982,400.00

Add Alt #1 $65,000.00 $54,700.00 $54,000.00

Total Bid (Base Bid + Alt) $15,000.00 $3,454,700.00 $3,036,400.00

Alt #2 $15,000.00

Company Gail Armstrong Const. Globe Const. Co. J.L. Walker Const. (C1)
Base Bid $3,122,000.00 $3,230,000.00 $3,265,000.00

Add Alt #1 $57,000.00 $69,500.00 $18,000.00

Total Bid (Base Bid + Alt) $3,179,000.00 $3,299,500.00 $3,283,000.00

Company Landmark Const. Group Nashert Constructors, Inc. W.L. McNatt & Co. (C1)
Base Bid $3,427,000.00 $3,339,000.00 $3.055,000.00

Add Alt #1 $46,000.00 $38,000.00 $37,000.00

Total Bid (Base Bid + Alt) $3,473,000.00 $3,377,000.00 $3,092,000.00

OKC CONSTRUCTION ITEM #4 PM-0209 SNOW AND ICE PLOWING AND REMOVAL SERVICES

Company/ Atlas Paving

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* 2 $100.00 $115.00 $140.00
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 8 $110.00 $125.00 $150.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 8 $125.00 $140.00 $165.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 4 $185.00 $225.00 $250.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 5 $175.00 $210.00 $235.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Company/ Haskell Lemon

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* None None None None
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
to12 yds.* None None None None
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 10 $75.00 $85.00 $100.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $125.00 $150.00 $200.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $125.00 $150.00 $200.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 2 $150.00 $175.00 $225.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY None None None None




The City of

(405) 297-2391

Company/ Markwell Paving

JOKLAHOMA CITY

City Clerk's Office
Frances Kersey, City Clerk

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip
Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* 2 $75.00 $125.00 $150.00
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 2 $75.00 $125.00 $150.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* None None None None
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $165.00 $200.00 $275.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $150.00 $170.00 $200.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 1 $150.00 $170.00 $200.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 2 $100.00 $120.00 $150.00
Company/ Nash Construction
Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* 5 $65.00 $70.00 $75.00
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 5 $65.00 $70.00 $75.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 5 $70.00 $75.00 $80.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $120.00 $130.00 $140.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $120.00 $130.00 $140.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 1 $150.00 $160.00 $180.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 4 $100.00 $120.00 $140.00




The City of

(405) 297-2391

Company/ Rudy Construction Co.

JOKLAHOMA CITY

City Clerk's Office
Frances Kersey, City Clerk

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* None None None None
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 5 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 2 $125.00 $125.00 $125.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $175.00 $175.00 $75.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 1 $200.00 $200.00 $200.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 4 $100.00 $120.00 $140.00

Company/ Schwarz Paving

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* 0 0 0 0
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 5 $110.00 $135.00 $155.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 5 $125.00 $160.00 $180.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 5 $200.00 $225.00 $245.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 3 $200.00 $225.00 $245.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 2 $200.00 $225.00 $245.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 4 $175.00 $200.00 $230.00




The City of

(405) 297-2391

Company/ Shell Construction

JOKLAHOMA CITY

City Clerk's Office
Frances Kersey, City Clerk

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
to12 yds.* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $140.00 $200.00 $250.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $140.00 $200.00 $250.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 2 $140.00 $200.00 $250.00

Company/ Silver Star Construction

Hourly Cost/Unit

Total Cost/Hr for Operator & Equip

Item No. Equip. & Operators Operator & Equip. | 8amto 5pm | 5pm to 8am | Holidays
Units Avail.
1000.18 Dump Truck & Driver
Less than 10 yds.* 0 0 0 0
1000.19 Dump Truck & Driver 10
t012 yds.* 2 $77.00 $88.00 $99.00
1000.20 Dump Truck & Driver
Over 12 yds.* 2 $88.00 $99.00 $110.00
1000.21 Motor Grader w/Operator
125 H.P. and over 2 $135.00 $161.00 $188.00
1000.22 Front End Loader
W/Operator 2 CY and over 2 $115.00 $142.00 $168.00
w/smooth edged bucket
1000.23 Dozier W/Operator Over
140 H.P. 1 $213.00 $230.00 $247.00
1000.24 Loader W/Operator less
than 2CY 2 $85.00 $102.00 $118.00
Cheryl Moses Maxine Anderson Tim Alvarez
City Clerk Procurement Auditor




City Clerk's Office
Frances Kersey, City Clerk
(405) 297-2391

PROCUREMENT
BID/PRICING AGREEMENT/ ANTICOLLUSION BID BOND:
CONTRACT FORM: AFFIDAVIT:
Not included or incomplete Not included Bond Missing
Not signed or original Not signed or original Bond in insufficient amount

Request Letter of Authorization Not properly notarized Incorrect Awarding Agency
Text has been altered Not signed or original

CONSTRUCTION

ANTICOLLUSION AFFIDAVIT: BUSINESS RELATIONSHIP AFFIDAVIT:
Not included Blanks not completed
Not signed or original Not included
Not properly notarized Not signed or original
Text has been altered Not properly notarized

Text has been altered
LOCAL BUSINESS UTILIZATION (City

BID BOND: and OCMAPS only):
Bond Missing Not included
Bond in insufficient amount Blanks not completed
Incorrect Awarding Agency Amounts incorrect
Not signed or original Not signed or original
BID FORM: OTHER DEFECTS:

Not Included

Not signed or original
Not sealed
Improperly executed

Request Letter of Authorization

I




	BID BOND:

